

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2023
QUARTER: 4

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
1	2023-068	REPAIR OF 3 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT PARANG CUEVA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, BATANGAS CITY	2,000,000.00	San Andres, Isla Verde, Batangas City	SUNLIGHT BUILDERS AND SUPPLY	Barangay Alangilan, Batangas City	1,998,000.00	23-Oct-23	92
2	2023-069	CONSTRUCTION OF 2 STOREY 6 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT MALITAM ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, BATANGAS CITY	20,700,000.00	MALITAM	VICMAR CONSTRUCTION INC.	Arce Subdivision, Batangas City	20,698,680.00	23-Oct-23	240
3	2023-070	CONSTRUCTION/COMPLETION OF 2 STOREY 4 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING (PHASE II) AT	819,800.42	SAN AGAPITO	GCF FETALVERO CONSTRUCTION AND ENTERPRISES	De Joya Bayview Village, Batangas City	817,200.00	23-Oct-23	60
4	2023-071	CONSTRUCTION/REHABILITATION OF BARANGAY HEALTH CENTER AT ALANGILAN, BATANGAS CITY	4,785,840.07	ALANGILAN	ROMAC BUILDERS	Dumuclay, Batangas City	4,780,950.00	23-Oct-23	120
5	2023-072	CONSTRUCTION OF SLOPE PROTECTION / RIPRAP OF MULTIPURPOSE COVERED COURT AT TALAHIB PAYAPA, BATANGAS CITY	3,500,000.00	TALAHIB PAYAPA	SUNLIGHT BUILDERS AND SUPPLY	Barangay Alangilan, Batangas City	3,498,000.00	23-Oct-23	100
6	2023-073	CONSTRUCTION OF BATANGAS CITY COMMAND CENTER PHASE 6 AT BARANGAY BOLBOK, BATANGAS CITY	46,208,804.18	BOLBOK	VICMAR CONSTRUCTION INC.	Arce Subdivision, Batangas City	46,205,680.00	23-Oct-23	210
7	2023-074	CONSTRUCTION / REHABILITATION OF PNP ARMORY AT GKK BUILDING, BATANGAS CITY	2,500,000.00	Brgy. 17, Batangas City	FILCAN UNITED CONSTRUCTION & GENERAL MERCHANDISE CORP.	Brgy. Pinagtung-ulan, San Jose, Batangas	2,499,000.00	23-Oct-23	60

8	2023-075	CONSTRUCTION OF 2 STOREY 4 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING PHASE I AT STO. NIÑO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL I, BATANGAS CITY	15,640,000.00	STO. NIÑO	GCF FETALVERO CONSTRUCTION AND ENTERPRISES	De Joya Bayview Village, Batangas City	15,637,100.00	23-Oct-23	240
9	2023-076	REPAIR OF FENCE AT TALUMPOK PROPER ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, BATANGAS CITY	2,500,000.00	TALUMPOK PROPER	ROMAC BUILDERS	Dumuclay, Batangas City	2,498,950.00	23-Oct-23	100
10	2023-077	CONSTRUCTION OF DRAINAGE, RIPRAP, FENCE AT PINAMUCAN IS	3,000,000.00	Pinamucan Proper, Batangas City	SUNLIGHT BUILDERS AND SUPPLY	Barangay Alangilan, Batangas City	2,998,000.00	23-Oct-23	56
11	2023-078	CONSTRUCTION OF PROTECTION DIKE/SEAWALL AT PAGKILATAN, BATANGAS	2,000,000.00	PAGKILATAN	SUNLIGHT BUILDERS AND SUPPLY	Barangay Alangilan, Batangas City	1,998,000.00	23-Oct-23	80
12	2023-079	CONSTRUCTION/REPAIR OF DRAINAGE SYSTEM AT ILANG ILANG STREET, MALITAM, BATANGAS	2,511,361.50	MALITAM	SUNLIGHT BUILDERS AND SUPPLY	Barangay Alangilan, Batangas City	2,509,800.00	23-Oct-23	80
13	2023-080	CONSTRUCTION OF 2 STOREY 6 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING TALUMPOK IS	26,010,028.42	Talumpok West, Batangas City	VICMAR CONSTRUCTION INC.	Arce Subdivision, Batangas City	26,007,680.00	23-Oct-23	520
14	2023-081	CONSTRUCTION OF 2 STOREY 8 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING	2,000,000.00	TINGA LABAC	VICMAR CONSTRUCTION INC.	Arce Subdivision, Batangas City	1,998,680.00	23-Oct-23	120
15	2023-082	CONSTRUCTION OF PERIMETER FENCE MARUCLAP ES (PHASE I)	1,150,000.00	MARUCLAP	VICMAR CONSTRUCTION INC.	Arce Subdivision, Batangas City	1,148,680.00	23-Oct-23	60
16	2023-083	CONSTRUCTION OF MANGO PROCESSING CENTER BUILDING CITY AGRICULTURE OFFICE, OCVAS COMPOUND, BATANGAS CITY	4,087,407.30	Bolbok, Batangas City	715 BUILDERS	Banaba Center, Batangas City	4,083,800.00	23-Oct-23	160
17	2023-084	CONSTRUCTION OF CORN STORAGE FACILITY CITY AGRICULTURE OFFICE, OCVAS COMPOUND, BATANGAS CITY	3,000,000.00	Bolbok, Batangas City	715 BUILDERS	Banaba Center, Batangas City	2,997,000.00	23-Oct-23	88
18	2023-085	CONSTRUCTION OF MULTIPURPOSE COVERED COURT BARANGAY 12, BATANGAS CITY	8,500,000.00	BARANGAY 12	PPG CONSTRUCTION CORPORATION	National Highway, Kumintang Ilaya, Batangas City	8,497,500.00	23-Oct-23	240

19	2023-086	CONSTRUCTION OF 4 STOREY 24 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT JAPMES	57,000,000.00	Cuta, Batangas City	NOW BUILDERS	Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	56,989,880.00	21-Nov-23	500
20	2023-087	CONSTRUCTION OF 2 STOREY 8 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT BATANGAS CITY SOUTH ES (FOR SHS)	28,750,000.00	Brgy. 7, Batangas City	BERTO LUCCI BUILDERS AND SUPPLY	#67 Evangelista St., Barangay 8, Batangas City	28,748,500.00	21-Nov-23	240
21	2023-088	CONSTRUCTION OF 3 STOREY 15 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT TINGGA SORO SORO IS	40,000,000.00	SOROSORO	NOW BUILDERS	Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	39,993,880.00	21-Nov-23	272
22	2023-089	CONSTRUCTION OF 2 STOREY 4 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING – JOSE C. PASTOR MES AT PALLOCAN WEST, BATANGAS CITY	10,350,000.00	PALLOCAN WEST	RM TEJADA AND SUPPLIES CORPORATION	MS. MARISSA C. TEJADA Sitio Cumba, San Jose Sico, Batangas City	10,346,815.00	21-Nov-23	192
23	2023-090	CONSTRUCTION OF 3 STOREY 12 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT MAHABANG PARANG ES	38,705,628.48	MAHABANG PARANG	BERTO LUCCI BUILDERS AND SUPPLY	#67 Evangelista St., Barangay 8, Batangas City	38,703,000.00	21-Nov-23	260
24	2023-091	CONSTRUCTION OF 3 STOREY 15 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT TALAHIB PANDAYAN NHS	43,243,970.32	TALAHIB PANDAYAN	VICMAR CONSTRUCTION INC.	Arce Subdivision, Batangas City	43,236,680.00	21-Nov-23	312
25	2023-092	REPAIR / IMPROVEMENT OF 2 STOREY EBD BUILDING AT ILIJAN ES	4,866,000.00	ILIJAN	RRE ERECTOR'S CONSTRUCTION AND TRADING SPECIALIST	67 Evangelista Street, Batangas City	4,863,800.00	21-Nov-23	140
26	2023-093	CONSTRUCTION OF STAGE WITH EXTENDED ROOFING AT SAN AGAPITO ES – ANNEX P1	2,761,440.00	SAN AGAPITO, ISLA VERDE	GCF FETALVERO CONSTRUCTION AND ENTERPRISES	De Joya Bayview Village, Batangas City	2,758,300.00	21-Nov-23	100
27	2023-094	CONCRETING OF FARM TO MARKET ROAD AT TALAHIB PANDAYAN, BATANGAS CITY	6,606,882.17	TALAHIB PANDAYAN	P-SQUARE CONTRACTING AND SERVICES	Brgy Catandala, Ibaan, Batangas	6,603,950.00	21-Nov-23	160
28	2023-095	REHABILITATION OF / IMPROVEMENT OF THE PEOPLE'S QUADRANGLE INCLUDING COMFORT ROOM AT BATANGAS CITY	15,000,000.00	Brgy. 17, Batangas City	MASTER BUILDER GENERAL CONTRACTOR INC.	Unit 2408 World Trade Exchange Bldg., 215 Juan Luna St., Binondo, Manila	14,996,800.00	21-Nov-23	280

29	2023-096	IMPROVEMENT/UPGRADING/REHABILITATION OF CITY CEMETERY AND PARKS/OPEN SPACES-PHASE II AT BOLBOK, BATANGAS CITY	89,966,629.47	BOLBOK	BERTO LUCCI BUILDERS AND SUPPLY	#67 Evangelista St., Barangay 8, Batangas City	89,964,800.00	21-Nov-23	420
30	2023-097	CONSTRUCTION OF MULTIPURPOSE COVERED COURT AT MARUCLAP, BATANGAS CITY	15,000,000.00	MARUCLAP	ROMAC Builders	Dumuclay, Batangas City	14,995,950.00	5-Dec-23	280

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.
EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E. EnP
 BAC Secretariat

sgd.
GILDA L. GODOY, EnP
 BAC Vice-Chairperson

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES - BID OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2023
QUARTER: 4

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
1	BAC-PG-631-2023	Supply & Delivery of Organic Multi-Purpose Cleaner	5,074,456.25	City ENRO, Batangas City	Jofarenz Printing & Enterprises	JENNIFER C. MABITUIN/ U-407 F. Jade Center, 105 Shaw Blvd. Oranbo, Pasig City	5,072,970.00	12.05.23	01.15.24
2	BAC-PG-632-2023	Agricultural Trailer with Water Tanks, Power sprayer and hose	1,307,560.00	City Agriculture Office, Batangas City	D.Dimaandal Car Care Center	DANTE V. DIMAANDAL/TOLENTINO ROAD, KUMINTANG IBABA, BATANGAS CITY	1,307,000.00	12.05.23	01.15.24
3	BAC-PG-633-2023	Various Materials	0.30	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Rockgold Trading & Equipment Rental	Rolly Dy Tan/Nat'l. Road, Gulod Labac, Batangas City	1,260,888.00	12.05.23	01.15.24
4	BAC-PG-634-2023	Various Submersible Pump	200,000.00	CPDO, Batangas City	Nemar Lumber & Hardware Corp.	Philip Chua/Brgy. Calicanto, Batangas City	1,995,000.00	12.05.23	01.15.24
5	BAC-PG-635-2023	Installation of 3 units Greenhouse Structure	5,540,000.00	City Agriculture Office, Batangas City	Society Glass & Gabriel Builders Inc.	Teresa T. Co/National Road, Brgy. Bolbok, Batangas City	5,539,000.00	12.05.23	01.15.24
6	BAC-PG-660-2023	Repair and Maintenance of Various Services Vehicles	776,805.11	Batangas City Government	D.Dimaandal Car Care Center	DANTE V. DIMAANDAL/TOLENTINO ROAD, KUMINTANG IBABA, BATANGAS CITY	776,630.50	12.06.23	01.17.24
7	BAC-PG-661-2023	Various Materials	447,725.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Cosworx Trading	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	446,925.00	12.06.23	01.17.24
8	BAC-PG-662-2023	Various Office Supplies & Equipment	307,647.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Gensson Trade Corporation	ALBERTO UY BOMPING/P. ZAMORA ST., POBLACION 16, BATANGAS CITY	307,357.00	12.06.23	01.17.24
9	BAC-PG-663-2023	Installation of Tint, Cabinet Signages & Aluminum Swing Door	146,720.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Society Glass & Gabriel Builders Inc.	Teresa T. Co/National Road, Brgy. Bolbok, Batangas City	146,700.00	12.06.23	01.17.24
10	BAC-PG-664-2023	Various Materials	180,058.75	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	State Construction & Mill Supply	Virginia Cortes/D. Silang St., Batangas City	180,043.25	12.06.23	01.17.24
11	BAC-PG-665-2023	Repair and Maintenance of Various Services Vehicles	129,460.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	RBC Petron Gasoline Station	RODRIGO B. CASTILLO/ KUMINTANG ILAYA, BATANGAS CITY	129,118.00	12.06.23	01.17.24
12	BAC-PG-666-2023	Refilling of Fire Extinguisher	196,500.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	DMB FIRE & Safety Enterprises Int'l. Inc.	Veksler Jason I. Brucal/Alangilan, Batangas City	196,446.00	12.06.23	01.17.24

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

 MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head

 ATTY. TEODULFO A. DEGUITO
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES -BID OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2023
QUARTER: 4

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
1	BAC-PG-667-2023	Various Office Supplies & Equipment	491,837.00	Sangguniang Panlungsod	1 SBMA Wholesaling	RYAN JOSEPH ILAGAN/Brgy. Rizal Ave., Poblacion 21 Batangas City	490,923.00	12.06.23	01.17.24
2	BAC-PG-668-2023	Installation of Hanging Cabinet	136,200.00	RTC Branch 8 Hall of Justice, Batangas City	Terravita Construction Trading	PAULEEN TURGO/Sitio Duluhan, Cuta Batangas City	135,500.00	12.06.23	01.17.24
3	BAC-PG-669-2023	Various Supplies and Materials	146,510.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	146,460.00	12.06.23	01.17.24
4	BAC-PG-670-2023	Installation of Various Airconditioning Units	139,200.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Jaime B.M Refrigeration & Airconditioning	Jaime B. Magadia/Brgy. Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	139,150.00	12.06.23	01.17.24
5	BAC-PG-671-2023	Repair and Installation of Parts of Genrator Sets	293,500.00	CDRRMO, Batangas City	Rockgold Trading & Equipment Rental	Rolly Dy Tan/Nat'l. Road, Gulod Labac, Batangas City	293,496.00	12.06.23	01.17.24
6	BAC-PG-672-2023	Customized Polo Shirt	113,100.00	City Market Administrator's Batangas City	Tatao Shirts & Gen. Mdse.	Tomas E. Mojares/P. Torres St., Brgy. 3, Lipa City	113,027.50	12.11.23	01.22.24
7	BAC-PG-673-2023	Installation of Smart Curtain	61,648.00	Sangguniang Panlungsod	Asian Gen. Mdse.	ESTELITA A. ALDA/Sitio Malaya, Pinamucan Ibaba, Batangas City	61,603.47	12.11.23	01.22.24
8	BAC-PG-677-2023	Corporate Jacket with Embroidery	150,800.00	City Budget Office, Batangas City	Goldmine Printing Press	Goldmine Printing Press	150,774.00	12.11.23	01.22.24
9	BAC-PG-678-2023	Repair and Maintenance of Various Services Vehicles	592,240.00	City Engineers Office, Batangas City	Automatic Motors	Ma. Arlene Montalbo/Brgy. Balagtas, Batangas City	591,240.00	12.11.23	01.22.24
10	BAC-PG-679-2023	Rental of Sounds, Lights, Complete Stage & LED Wall Screen	20,000.00	City Mayor's Office, Batangas City	DVD POWER BEAT	DANTE V. DIMAANDAL/TOLENTINO ROAD, KUMINTANG IBABA, BATANGAS CITY	199,900.00	12.11.23	01.22.24
11	BAC-PG-680-2023	Various Office Supplies & Equipment	236,015.45	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	ABCC Sales & Services	Claudia Girlie C. Marcial/ABCC Bldg. Batangas City	235,000.00	12.11.23	01.22.24
12	BAC-PG-684-2023	Various Materials	495,144.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Rockgold Trading & Equipment Rental	Rolly Dy Tan/Nat'l. Road, Gulod Labac, Batangas City	495,122.00	12.11.23	01.22.24

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.
 MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.
 ATTY. TEODULFO A. DEGUITO
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES -BID OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2023
QUARTER: 4

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
1	BAC-PG-700-2023	Complete of Various RP Vehicles	247,000.00	Batangas City Government	D.Dimaandal Car Care Center	DANTE V. DIMAANDAL/TOLENTINO ROAD, KUMINTANG IBABA, BATANGAS CITY	246,900.00	12.12.23	01.23.24
2	BAC-PG-699-2023	Day Old Chicks	999,948.00	Office of the City Veterinary, Batangas City	IBN MARKETING	Imelda Macalinta/Emerald Homes Subd. Brgy. Tambo, Lipa City	999,223.40	12.12.23	01.23.24
3	BAC-PG-697-2023	Supply and Delivery of Printing of Tarpaulins	499,980.00	City Mayor's Office, Batangas City	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	499,935.00	12.12.23	01.23.24
4	BAC-PG-696-2023	Food Supplies	404,415.00	City Treasurer's Office, Batangas City	Ten 25 Enterprises	Maria Lea Macatangay/Brgy. Tulo, Batangas City	403,945.00	12.12.23	01.23.24
5	BAC-PG-695-2023	Printing of Stickers	157,500.00	General Services Department, Batangas City	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	156,600.00	12.12.23	01.23.24
6	BAC-PG-732-2023	Plaques and Trophies	149,000.00	City Mayor's Office, Batangas City	Gold & Silver Metal Arts & Gen. Mdse.	ROLANDO MENDOZA/D. Silang St., Batangas City	148,820.00	12.12.23	01.23.24
7	BAC-PG-712-2023	Vulcanizing Services of Various RP Vehicles of Batangas City Government	301,000.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	D.Dimaandal Car Care Center	DANTE V. DIMAANDAL/TOLENTINO ROAD, KUMINTANG IBABA, BATANGAS CITY	300,800.00	12.12.23	01.23.24
8	BAC-PG-724-2023	Rental of Motor Vehicle	968,000.00	Dep.Ed., Division, Batangas City	D.Dimaandal Car Care Center	DANTE V. DIMAANDAL/TOLENTINO ROAD, KUMINTANG IBABA, BATANGAS CITY	967,600.00	12.19.23	02.02.24
9	BAC-PG-736-2023	Printing of Tickets, Tshirt, Polo Shirt, Picture Framing and ID with Lace	151,536.00	City Mayor's Office, Batangas City	Tatao Shirts & Gen. Mdse.	Tomas E. Mojares/P. Torres St., Brgy. 3, Lipa City	151,536.00	12.19.23	02.02.24
10	BAC-PG-729-2023	Meals and Snacks	721,000.00	Batangas City PNP	Triple 8 Carinderia & Catering Services	Julita A. Macatangay/Sta. Rita Carsada, Batangas City	720,600.00	12.19.23	02.02.24
11	BAC-PG-734-2023	Various Forms, Tarpaulins & Stickers	278,450.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	278,440.00	12.19.23	02.02.24
12	BAC-PG-733-2023	Meals and Snacks	345,635.00	CMO-PESO, Batangas City	Citichow Corp.	Carlito Go /Citimart Complex, Rizal Avenue Batangas City	345,236.00	12.19.23	02.02.24

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.
 MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.
 ATTY. TEODULFO A. DEGUITO
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES -BID OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2023
QUARTER: 4

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
1	BAC-PG-728-2023	Various Materials	999,980.00	City Mayor's Office, Batangas City	Rockgold Trading & Equipment Rental	Rolly Dy Tan/Nat'l. Road, Gulod Labac, Batangas City	999,953.00	12.19.23	02.02.24
2	BAC-PG-711-2023	Various Office & IT Supplies and Cleaning Materials	797,263.45	Sangguniang Panlungsod	1 SBMA Supply Wholesaling	RYAN JOSEPH ILAGAN/Brgy. Rizal Ave., Poblacion 21 Batangas City	796,713.00	12.19.23	02.02.24
3	BAC-PG-731-2023	Meals and Snacks	489,400.00	HRMDO, Batangas City	Triple 8 Carinderia & Catering Services	Julita A. Macatangay/Sta. Rita Carsada, Batangas City	488,550.00	12.19.23	02.02.24
4	BAC-PG-709-2023	Fresh Milk	999,905.00	CSWDO, Batangas City	SoroSoro Ibaba Dev't. Cooperative	RICO B. GERON/Soro-Soro Ibaba, Batangas City	999,905.00	12.19.23	02.02.24
5	BAC-PG-735-2023	Various Office Supplies & Equipment	231,885.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Chels and Clyde Trading	Marian Mendoza/BLK -26 LT-2 MEDELLIN ST., LAGUNA HILLS, PANSOL, CALAMBA CITY LAGUNA	231,685.00	12.19.23	02.02.24
6	BAC-PG-730-2023	Learning Materials	449,079.00	CSWDO, Batangas City	Chels and Clyde Trading	Marian Mendoza/BLK -26 LT-2 MEDELLIN ST., LAGUNA HILLS, PANSOL, CALAMBA CITY LAGUNA	449,079.00	12.19.23	02.02.24
7	BAC-PG-738-2023	Various Toner	132,808.00	Colegio ng Lungsod ng Batangas	Philippine Duplicators, Inc.	MARIA TERESA NAVARRO/Edison Ave., Merville, Paranaque City	132,700.00	12.21.23	02.05.24
8	BAC-PG-739-2023	Tokens	360,500.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Ten 25 Enterprises	Maria Lea Macatangay/Brgy. Tulo, Batangas City	360,306.00	12.21.23	02.05.24
9	BAC-PG-740-2023	Meals and Snacks	999,241.50	Batangas City PNP	Grandiose Food Service Inc.	Felie Go/D. Silang St., cor P. Burgos St. Pob. 14, Batangas City	992,715.00	12.21.23	02.05.24
10	BAC-PG-741-2023	Tree Units Grass Cutter	75,660.00	City ENRO, Batangas City	Gensson Trade Corp.	ALBERTO UY BOMPING/P. ZAMORA ST., POBLACION 16, BATANGAS CITY	75,570.00	12.21.23	02.05.24
11	BAC-PG-744-2023	Electrical Materials	119,828.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	State Construction & Mill Supply	Virginia Cortes/D. Silang St., Batangas City	119,810.50	12.21.23	02.05.24
12	BAC-PG-742-2023	Hotel Accommodation with Meals	250,000.00	City Mayor's Office, Batangas City	Hotel Concept, Inc.	YUKI NAKAMURA/Brgy. Gulod Labac, Batangas City	250,000.00	12.28.23	02.08.24

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.
 MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.
 ATTY. TEODULFO A. DEGUI TO
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES -BID OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2023
QUARTER: 4

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
1	BAC-PG-708-2023	Cleaning Materials	2,946,860.85	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Smartbiz Trading & Gen. Mdse.	Wherlyn Manansala/#10 Buenafe St., Brgy. 19, Batangas City	2,946,361.35	12.28.23	02.08.24
2	BAC-PG-707-2023	Meals and Snacks	2,298,700.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Citichow Corp.	Carlito Go /Citimart Complex, Rizal Avenue Batangas City	2,294,380.00	12.28.23	02.08.24
3	BAC-PG-706-2023	Various IT Supplies	7,215,495.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Ten 25 Enterprises	Maria Lea Macatangay/Brgy. Tulo, Batangas City	7,212,272.00	12.28.23	02.08.24
4	BAC-PG-705-2023	Various Office Supplies	7,644,805.55	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Ten 25 Enterprises	Maria Lea Macatangay/Brgy. Tulo, Batangas City	7,596,420.50	12.28.23	02.08.24
5	BAC-PG-704-2023	Meals and Snacks	1,655,500.00	City Veterinary & Agriculture Office, Batangas City	Triple 8 Carinderia & Catering Services	Julita A. Macatangay/Sta. Rita Carsada, Batangas City	1,655,420.50	12.28.23	02.08.24
6	BAC-PG-703-2023	Rental of Sounds, Lights, Complete Stage, Aluminum Trusses, LED Wall Screen & Projector Screen	1,500,000.00	City Mayor's Office, Batangas City	RMA lights and Sounds	Ramon R. Tayer Salaban II, Ibaan, Batangas	149,900.00	12.28.23	02.08.24
7	BAC-PG-702-2023	Repair and Restoration of CCTV Surveillance System	3,488,776.00	Batangas City Government	Orange IT Exchange	TIMOTHY E.EVANGELISTA/MEZZANINE B-4 LPL CENTER BLDG. 130 L.P. LEVISTE ST., SALCEDO VILLAGE, MAKATI CITY	3,486,776.00	12.28.23	02.08.24
8	BAC-PG-694-2023	Procurement of Security Services	22,317,120.00	Batangas City Government	Nino Jesus Security Services Corp.	RUEL S. SAONOV/215 Arce Subdivision, Kumintang Ibaan, Batangas City	22,317,057.00	12.28.23	02.08.24
9	BAC-PG-693-2023	Procurement of Janitorial Services	16,635,402.00	Batangas City Government	AGP Sales & Services, Inc.	ANTONIO G. PEREZ/90 D. Silang St., Poblacion 7, Batangas City	16,635,213.00	12.28.23	02.08.24
10	BAC-PG-692-2023	Procurement of Coastal Security, Environmental & Disaster Patrol Services	9,000,000.00	Batangas City Government	Nino Jesus Security Services Corp.	RUEL S. SAONOV/215 Arce Subdivision, Kumintang Ibaan, Batangas City	8,964,000.00	12.28.23	02.08.24
11	BAC-PG-691-2023	Ecological Waste Collection, Transportation & Disposal Project to DENR Compliant Sanitary Landfill	134,597,561.40	Batangas City Government	SB Hain Enterprises & Gen. Services Inc.	AURORA C. HAIN NIA Rd. Brgy. Niugan, City of Cabuyao, Laguna	134,593,224.30	12.28.23	02.08.24
12	BAC-PG-690-2023	Meals and Snacks	3,795,700.00	CSWDO, Batangas City	Tia Rosa's Catering	Mary Ann Ramirez/Alangilan Batangas City	3,794,044.00	12.28.23	02.08.24

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

 MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head

 ATTY. TEODULFO A. DEGUITO
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES - BID OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)
CALENDAR YEAR: 2023
QUARTER: 4

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
1	BAC-PG-689-2023	Repair and Maintenance of Various Airconditioning Units	5,870,000.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Jaime B.M Refrigeration & Airconditioning	Jaime B. Magadia/Brgy. Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	5,868,000.00	12.28.23	02.08.24
2	BAC-PG-688-2023	Fuel,Oil & Lubricants	26,952,000.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	RBC Petron Gasoline Station	RODRIGO B. CASTILLO/ KUMINTANG ILAYA, BATANGAS CITY	26,947,450.00	12.28.23	02.08.24
3	BAC-PG-687-2023	Purified Drinking Water	1,865,920.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Gaves Water Refilling Station	Emma M. Tresvalles/Brgy. Gulod Labac, Batangas City	1,865,158.40	12.28.23	02.08.24
4	BAC-PG-686-2023	Rental of Photocopying Machine	1,195,000.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Efren Reyes Telecopy Trading & Services	Efren M. Reyes/Brgy. Calicanto, Batangas City	1,195,000.00	12.28.23	02.08.24
5	BAC-PG-685-2023	Various Sport Uniform	4,655,300.00	Dep.Ed.,Division, Batangas City	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	4,655,260.00	12.28.23	02.08.24
6	BAC-PG-723-2023	Bokashi Balls	5,000,000.00	City ENRO, Batangas City	Verde Solutions & Innovarion Corp.	Jennifer C. Mabituin/Jade Centre, 105 Shaw Blvd., Oranbo, Pasig City	4,998,500.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
7	BAC-PG-722-2023	Rental of Motor Vehicle with Driver	3,476,000.00	Batangas City PNP	D.Dimaandal Car Care Center	DANTE V. DIMAANDAL/TOLENTINO ROAD, KUMINTANG IBABA, BATANGAS CITY	3,475,131.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
8	BAC-PG-721-2023	Zoological Supplies	2,263,620.00	City Veterinary Office, Batangas City	IBN Marketing	Imelda Macalintal/Emerald Homes Subd. Brgy. Tambo, Lipa City	2,261,870.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
9	BAC-PG-720-2023	Polo Shirt	1,575,000.00	CMO-KALIPI, Batangas City	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	1,572,900.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
10	BAC-PG-719-2023	Meals and Snacks and Venue	4,950,000.00	Dep.Ed.,Division, Batangas City	Norma Cleofe's Canteen	Norma Cleofe/BRH Compound, Kumintang Ibaba Batangas City	4,948,680.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
11	BAC-PG-718-2023	Various Materials for the repair and Improvement of Various Barangay Roads	4,000,000.00	Batangas City	Cosworx Trading	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	3,996,500.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
12	BAC-PG-717-2023	Meals and Snacks for the conduct of various cultural activities	1,952,400.00	City Mayor's Office, Batangas City	Norma Cleofe's Canteen	Norma Cleofe/BRH Compound, Kumintang Ibaba Batangas City	1,951,830.00	12.29.23	02.10.24

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

 MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.

 ATTY. TEODULFO A. DEGUITO
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES - BID OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2023
QUARTER: 4

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
1	BAC-PG-716-2023	Various Learning Materials	2,850,000.00	CSWDO, Batangas City	ABC my practice Books, Enterprises	Rufino M. Gamad, Rosario Cavite	2,848,500.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
2	BAC-PG-715-2023	Meals and Snacks	5,585,570.00	CSWDO, Batangas City	Tia Rosa's Catering	Mary Ann Ramirez/Alangilan Batangas City	5,583,530.50	12.29.23	02.10.24
3	BAC-PG-747-2023	Meals and Snacks	1,299,405.00	Different Offices of Batangas City Government	Grandiose Food Services, Inc.	Felie Go/D. Silang St., cor P. Burgos St. Pob. 14, Batangas City	1,297,759.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
4	BAC-PG-746-2023	Meals and Snacks		City Mayor's Office, Batangas City	Norma Cleofe's Canteen	Norma Cleofe/BRH Compound, Kumintang Ibaba Batangas City	1,998,750.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
5	BAC-PG-745-2023	Printing of ECCD Checklist	1,500,000.00	CSWDO, Batangas City	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	1,499,900.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
6	BAC-PG-737-2023 LOT IV	Various Materials	978,075.00	Batangas City Government	Nemar Lumber & Hardware Corp.	Philip Chua/Brgy. Calicanto, Batangas City	976,801.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
6	BAC-PG-737-2023 LOT III	Various Materials	988,877.50	Batangas City Government	State Construction & Mill Supply	Virginia Cortes/D. Silang St., Batangas City	988,859.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
8	BAC-PG-737-2023 LOT II	Various Materials	1,202,636.30	Batangas City Government	Cosworx Trading	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	1,200,486.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
9	BAC-PG-737-2023 LOT I	Various Materials	9,140,370.00	Batangas City Government	Rockgold Trading and Equipment Rentals	Rolly Dy Tan/Nat'l. Road, Gulod Labac, Batangas City	9,140,278.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
10	BAC-PG-727-2023	Meals and Snacks	1,800,000.00	Dep.Ed., Division, Batangas City	Tia Rosa's Catering	Mary Ann Ramirez/Alangilan Batangas City	1,799,400.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
11	BAC-PG-726-2023	Various Plaques	1,490,775.00	City ENRO, Batangas City	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	1,490,670.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
12	BAC-PG-725-2023	Upgraded Female Goat Breeder	2,062,800.00	City Veterinary Office, Batangas City	IBN Marketing	Imelda Macalintal/Emerald Homes Subd. Brgy. Tambo, Lipa City	2,061,720.00	12.29.23	02.10.24
	BAC-PG-714-2023	Agricultural Supplies	3,231,232.00	City Agriculture Office, Batangas City	Nutrilink Enterprises	Eleuterio M. Mercado. Brgy. Bolbok, Lipa City	3,230,532.00	12.29.23	02.10.24

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.
MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.
ATTY. TEODULFO A. DEGUITO
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10c - Bid Results on Consulting Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

CONSULTING SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON **CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023
PROVINCE: BATANGAS **QUARTER:** 4
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Location	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
			No Consultancy Services						

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd
EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E., EnP
 BAC Secretariat

sgd
GILDA L. GODOY, EnP
 BAC Vice-Chairperson