

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 1

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
1	2024-001	CONSTRUCTION OF 2 STOREY 6 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT SAN MIGUEL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL	24,036,838.70	SAN MIGUEL, Batangas City	ROMAC BUILDERS	Dumuclay, Batangas City	24,032,750.00	14-Mar-24	240
2	2024-002	REHABILITATION OF BARANGAY ROAD (PUROK 1 TO PUROK 4) AT SIRANG LUPA, BATANGAS CITY	6,003,375.53	SIRANG LUPA, Batangas City	MAC BUILDERS CIVIL ENGINEERING CONSTRUCTION	Barangay Tulo, Batangas City	6,002,994.00	14-Mar-24	100
3	2024-003	CONSTRUCTION AND REHABILITATION OF CANAL (D. ATIENZA COR. NATIVIDAD ST. TO P. DANDAN) AT BARANGAY 3, BATANGAS CITY	1,756,466.57	BARANGAY 3, Batangas City	TOPSTEEL BUILDERS	Evangelista St., Poblacion 22, Batangas City	1,755,580.00	14-Mar-24	68
4	2024-004	REHABILITATION OF BARANGAY ROAD AT SITIO SILANGAN, SAN PEDRO, BATANGAS CITY	2,500,000.00	SAN PEDRO, Batangas City	EGP CONSTRUCTION & ENT.	Magnusville, Subdivision, Pallocan Kanluran, Batangas City	2,498,900.00	14-Mar-24	56
5	2024-005	IMPROVEMENT OF DRAINAGE SYSTEM (P. PANGANIBAN ST. CORNER P. PRIETO ST.) AT BARANGAY 2, BATANGAS CITY	4,200,000.00	BARANGAY 2, Batangas City	715 BUILDERS	Banaba Center, Batangas City	4,197,500.00	14-Mar-24	100
6	2024-006	CONSTRUCTION OF BOX CULVERT AND REHABILITATION OF BARANGAY ROAD (PUROK 3) AT CONDE ITAAS, BATANGAS CITY	5,500,000.00	CONDE ITAAS, Batangas City	KAPITAN 21 BUILDERS OPC	Barangay 22, Batangas City	5,497,300.00	14-Mar-24	180
7	2024-007	REPAIR / IMPROVEMENT OF SCHOOL BUILDING (CEILING) AT TALUMPOK PROPER ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, BATANGAS CITY	606,360.52	TALUMPOK PROPER, Batangas City	SUNLIGHT BUILDERS AND SUPPLY	Barangay Alangilan, Batangas City	604,480.00	14-Mar-24	24
8	2024-008	REHABILITATION / CONCRETING OF BARANGAY ROAD AT MAHABANG DAHILIG, BATANGAS CITY	48,145,563.69	MAHABANG DAHILIG, Batangas City	VICMAR CONSTRUCTION INC.	Barangay Calicanto, Batangas City	48,139,680.00	14-Mar-24	360

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E., EnP
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 1

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00002-2024	Rental of Sounds, Lights, Complete Stage, & LED Wall Screen	400,000.00	RMA Lights and Sounds	Ramon R. Taye / Salaban II, Ibaan, Batangas	399,700.00	02.01.2024
BAC-PG-00003-2024	Various Materials	757,219.70	Nemar Lumber and Hardware Corp.	Philip Chua/Brgy. Calicanto, Batangas City	754,742.00	02.01.2024
BAC-PG-00004-2024	Meals and Snacks	999,850.00	Norma Cleofe's Canteen	Norma Cleofe /Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	999,620.00	02.01.2024
BAC-PG-00006-2024	Publication of Financial Statement	300,000.00	Batangas Post	Jay Ferdinand C. Malaluan /Ilang-Ilang St., De Joya Compd., Alangilan, Batangas City	299,800.00	02.01.2024
BAC-PG-00007-2024	Printing of Forms, Newsletter & T-shirt	207,250.00	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	207,205.00	02.01.2024
BAC-PG-00008-2024	Various Office Equipment	433,950.00	MEL-C Trading	Imelda Coronel/Pinagkrusan, Alitagtag, batangas	433,750.00	02.01.2024
BAC-PG-00009-2024	Various Materials	248,100.00	Rockgold Trading & Equipment Rentals	Rolly Dy Tan/Nat'l. Road, Gulod Labac, Batangas City	248,089.00	02.01.2024
BAC-PG-00001-2024 LOT 1	Meals and Snacks	7,425,000.00	Tia Rosa's Catering	Mary Ann Ramirez/Alangilan Batangas City	7,423,650.00	02.01.2024
BAC-PG-00001-2024 LOT 2	Meals and Snacks	4,680,000.00	Tia Rosa's Catering	Mary Ann Ramirez/Alangilan Batangas City	4,679,280.00	02.01.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E., EnP
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 1

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00010-2024	Meals & Snacks	200,000.00	Grandiose Food Services, Inc.	Felie Go/D. Silang St., cor P. Burgos St. Pob. 14, Batangas City	199,900.00	02.07.2024
BAC-PG-00011-2024	Meals & Snacks	710,000.00	Tia Rosa's Catering	Mary Ann Ramirez/Alangilan Batangas City	709,645.00	02.07.2024
BAC-PG-00012-2024	Glass Plaques, Dry Seal & Signages	187,860.00	Gold & Silver Metal Arts & General Merchandise	Rolando Mendoza /D. Silang St., Batangas City	187,800.00	02.07.2024
BAC-PG-00013-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles	324,592.00	D. Dimaandal Car Care Center	Dante Dimaandal/Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	324,442.00	02.07.2024
BAC-PG-00015-2024	Printing of News Paper	220,500.00	NCMEPS Printing Services	Nancy Q. Malaluan / Ilang-Ilang St., De Joya Compd., Alangilan, Batangas City	220,000.00	02.07.2024
BAC-PG-00005-2024	Tokens	133,125.00	ABCC Sales & Services	Claudia Girlie C. Marcial/ABCC Bldg. Batangas City	133,125.00	02.07.2024
BAC-PG-00016-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles & Equipment	541,003.00	D. Dimaandal Car Care Center	Dante Dimaandal/Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	540,683.00	02.14.2024
BAC-PG-00017-2024	Meals & Snacks	263,000.00	Norma Cleofe's Canteen	Norma Cleofe /Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	262,845.00	02.14.2024
BAC-PG-00018-2024	Various Office Supplies & Equipment	362,557.50	Mel-C Trading	Imelda Coronel/Pinagkrusan, Alitagtag, batangas	362,407.50	02.14.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E., EnP
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 1

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00019-2024	Meals & Snacks	70,400.00	Grandiose Food Services, Inc.	Felie Go/D. Silang St., cor P. Burgos St. Pob. 14, Batangas City	70,160.00	02.14.2024
BAC-PG-00020-2024	Various Materials	667,350.00	Cosworx Trading	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	665,895.00	02.14.2024
BAC-PG-00021-2024	Meals & Snacks	84,710.00	Triple 8 Carindaria & Catering Sevices	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	81,675.00	02.14.2024
BAC-PG-00022-2024	Printing of Sticker & Letterhead	110,000.00	Grandeur Printing & General Merchandise	Luzviminda A. Villena / Brgy. Paharang East, Batangas City	109,950.00	02.14.2024
BAC-PG-00023-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles & Equipment	233,595.00	Automatic Motors	Ma. Arlene Montalbo/Brgy. Balagtas, Batangas City	233,072.00	02.16.2024
BAC-PG-00025-2024	Publication of City Ordinance	285,000.00	Batangas Post	Jay Ferdinand C. Malaluan /Ilang-Ilang St., De Joya Compd., Alangilan, Batangas City	284,848.00	02.16.2024
BAC-PG-00027-2024	Portable Handheld Radio w/ NTC License and Radio Base	468,000.00	Smartbiz Trading & General Merchandise	Wherlyn Manansala/#10 Buenafe St., Brgy. 19, Batangas City	467,500.00	02.16.2024
BAC-PG-00028-2024	Dismantling & Installation of various airconditioning units	479,500.00	Jaime B.M Refrigeration & Airconditioning	Jaime B. Magadia/Brgy. Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	479,200.00	02.16.2024
BAC-PG-00030-2024	Meals & Snacks	424,000.00	Tia Rosa's Catering	Mary Ann Ramirez/Alangilan Batangas City	423,440.00	02.16.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E., EnP
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 1

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00031-2024	Various Office Supplies & Equipment	431,390.00	Chels & Clyde Trading	Marian M. Mendoza / Laguna Hills Subd. Pansol, Calamba City	431,190.00	02.16.2024
BAC-PG-00032-2024	Various Materials	134,155.00	State Construction & Mill Supply	Virginia Cortes/D. Silang St., Batangas City	134,140.50	02.16.2024
BAC-PG-00014-2024	Meals & Snacks	9,853,200.00	Tia Rosa's Catering	Mary Ann Ramirez/Alangilan Batangas City	9,848,100.00	02.21.2024
BAC-PG-00033-2024	Various Materials	485,620.00	Cosworx Trading	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	484,420.00	02.21.2024
BAC-PG-00034-2024	Meals & Snacks	200,000.00	Casadesofia Restaurant	Banaba South, Diversion Road, Batangas City	199,850.00	02.21.2024
BAC-PG-00035-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles	658,179.00	D. Dimaandal Car Care Center	Dante Dimaandal/Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	6,579,639.00	02.21.2024
BAC-PG-00036-2024	Various Office Supplies & Materials	74,500.00	Smartbiz Trading & General Merchandise	Wherlyn Manansala/#10 Buenafe St., Brgy. 19, Batangas City	74,400.00	02.21.2024
BAC-PG-00037-2024	Meals & Snacks	176,000.00	Grandiose Food Services, Inc.	Felie Go/D. Silang St., cor P. Burgos St. Pob. 14, Batangas City	175,400.00	02.21.2024
BAC-PG-00038-2024	Various Materials	312,955.00	Rockgold Trading & Equipment Rentals	Rolly Dy Tan/Nat'l. Road, Gulod Labac, Batangas City	312,949.00	02.21.2024
BAC-PG-00048-2024	Various Materials	937,675.00	Rockgold Trading & Equipment Rentals	Rolly Dy Tan/Nat'l. Road, Gulod Labac, Batangas City	937,666.00	02.21.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E., EnP
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 1

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00043-2024	Meals & Snacks	676,998.00	Grandiose Food Services, Inc.	Felie Go/D. Silang St., cor P. Burgos St. Pob. 14, Batangas City	673,089.00	02.24.2024
BAC-PG-00040-2024	Meals & Snacks	252,000.00	Norma Cleofe's Canteen	Norma Cleofe /Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	251,600.00	02.28.2024
BAC-PG-00041-2024	Various Materials	193,120.00	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	193,092.00	02.28.2024
BAC-PG-00042-2024	Various Forms	749,800.00	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	749,693.00	02.28.2024
BAC-PG-00045-2024	Fuel, Oil & Lubricants	870,000.00	RBC Petron Gasoline Station	Rodrigo B. Castillo /Brgy.Kumintang Ilaya, Batangas City	869,700.00	02.28.2024
BAC-PG-00046-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles	365,343.19	SFM Sales Corp.	Eusebio N. Dy Jr. / 115 Ile De France St. Sta.Rosa Vill 4A, Sta.Rosa, Laguna	365,000.00	02.28.2024
BAC-PG-00047-2024	Meals & Snacks	954,250.00	Triple 8 Carinderia & Catering Sevices	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	953,872.50	02.28.2024
BAC-PG-00039-2024	Goods & Commodities	1,288,970.50	Smartbiz Trading & General Merchandise	Wherlyn Manansala/#10 Buenafe St., Brgy. 19, Batangas City	1,288,470.45	03.05.2024
BAC-PG-00047-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles	990,262.00	D. Dimaandal Car Care Center	Dante Dimaandal/Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	989,962.00	03.05.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E., EnP
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 1

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00053-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles	990,262.00	D. Dimaandal Car Care Center	Dante Dimaandal/Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	989,962.00	03.05.2024
BAC-PG-00054-2024	Meals & Snacks	912,040.00	Grandiose Food Services, Inc.	Felie Go/D. Silang St., cor P. Burgos St. Pob. 14, Batangas City	907,700.00	03.05.2024
BAC-PG-00055-2024	Trophies & Medals	999,950.00	Ten 25 Enterprises	Maria Lea Macatangay, Brgy. Tulo, Batangas City	49,997.50	03.05.2024
BAC-PG-00056-2024	Various Materials	320,642.00	State Construction & Mill Supply	Virginia Cortes/D. Silang St., Batangas City	297,809.50	03.05.2024
BAC-PG-00057-2024	Meals & Snacks	994,500.00	Triple 8 Carinderia & Catering Sevices	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	993,915.00	03.05.2024
BAC-PG-00059-2024	Meals & Snacks	338,255.00	Citi Chow Corp.	Carlito Go /Citimart Complex, Rizal Avenue	338,155.00	03.05.2024
BAC-PG-00049-2024	Printing Materials	1,110,000.00	Grandeur Printing & General Merchandise	Luzviminda A. Villena / Brgy. Paharang East, Batangas City	1,109,650.00	03.12.2024
BAC-PG-00050-2024	Various Operational Supplies	1,285,250.00	Ten 25 Enterprises	Maria Lea Macatangay, Brgy. Tulo, Batangas City	1,284,850.00	03.12.2024
BAC-PG-00051-2024	Various Materials	1,195,430.00	Rockgold Trading & Equipment Rentals	Rolly Dy Tan/Nat'l. Road, Gulod Labac, Batangas City	1,995,409.00	03.12.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E., EnP
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 1

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00066-2024	Printing of Booklets	935,000.00	Grandeur Printing & General Merchandise	Luzviminda A. Villena / Brgy. Paharang East, Batangas City	934,150.00	03.12.2024
BAC-PG-00067-2024	Office Supplies & Materials	391,119.00	Smartbiz Trading & General Merchandise	Wherlyn Manansala/#10 Buenafe St., Brgy. 19, Batangas City	390,819.00	03.12.2024
BAC-PG-00068-2024	Meals & Snacks	207,000.00	Triple 8 Carinderia & Catering Sevices	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	206,862.00	03.12.2024
BAC-PG-00069-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles	789,680.00	D. Dimaandal Car Care Center	Dante Dimaandal/Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	77,980.00	03.12.2024
BAC-PG-00070-2024	Brand New Portable Fire Pump	980,000.00	Fire Coach Trading	Christian John Rodriquez / 54 Don B Bautista Bldv., Ext., Damaplet, Malabon City	970,000.00	03.12.2024
BAC-PG-00071-2024	Meals and Snacks	400,000.00	Tia Rosa's Catering	Mary Ann Ramirez/Alangilan Batangas City	399,520.00	03.12.2024
BAC-PG-00072-2024	Various Materials	440,440.00	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	440,400.00	03.12.2024
BAC-PG-00073-2024	Meals and Snacks	252,340.00	Norma Cleofe's Canteen	Norma Cleofe /Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	252,295.00	03.14.2024
BAC-PG-00074-2024	Various Materials	839,005.00	Cosworx Trading	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	837,805.00	03.14.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E., EnP
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 1

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00075-2024	Learning Materials	739,300.00	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	739,086.00	03.14.2024
BAC-PG-00076-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles	147,490.00	RBC Petron Gasoline Station	Rodrigo B. Castillo /Brgy.Kumintang Ilaya, Batangas City	147,140.00	03.14.2024
BAC-PG-00077-2024	Trophies & Plaques	86,500.00	Gold & Silver Metal Arts & General Merchandise	Rolando Mendoza /D. Silang St., Batangas City	86,490.00	03.14.2024
BAC-PG-00078-2024	Agricultural Supplies	768,431.00	Nutrilink Enterprises	Eleuterio M. Mercado / Purok 4, Brgy. Bolbok, Lipa City	768,431.00	03.14.2024
BAC-PG-00079-2024	Meals & Snacks	70,400.00	Grandiose Food Services, Inc.	Felie Go/D. Silang St., cor P. Burgos St. Pob. 14, Batangas City	70,160.00	03.14.2024
BAC-PG-00080-2024	LPG Tanks & Fire Extinguisher	234,600.00	DMB Fire & Safety Enterprises Int'l, Inc.	Joanne Grace B. Mendoza /DMB Building 1 Diversion Road, Alangilan, Batangas City	234,369.00	03.14.2024
BAC-PG-00081-2024	Meals & Snacks	176,890.00	Citi Chow Corp.	Carlito Go /Citimart Complex, Rizal Avenue	176,814.00	03.14.2024
BAC-PG-00082-2024	Various Materials	467,676.00	State Construction & Mill Supply	Virginia Cortes/D. Silang St., Batangas City	467,665.00	03.14.2024
BAC-PG-00086-2024	CAD Printer	414,760.00	Gakken Philippines Inc.	Liza Q. Mendoza / #130 Aurora Boulevard Cor. A Lake St. Salapan, San Juan City	414,700.00	03.15.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E., EnP
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 1

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00087-2024	Fuel, Oil & Lubricants	870,000.00	RBC Petron Gasoline Station	Rodrigo B. Castillo /Brgy.Kumintang Ilaya, Batangas City	869,800.00	03.15.2024
BAC-PG-00088-2024	Various Materials	643,075.00	Cosworx Trading	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	642,125.00	03.15.2024
BAC-PG-00089-2024	Blue Printing of Plans	395,560.00	Grandeur Printing & General Merchandise	Luzviminda A. Villena / Brgy. Paharang East, Batangas City	395,020.00	03.15.2024
BAC-PG-00090-2024	Subscription of Google Workspace for Education Plus	587,000.00	Q Software Research Corp.	Ian C. Sison / Buni Aven. Brgy. New Zaniga, Mandaluyong, City	524,160.00	03.15.2024
BAC-PG-00061-2024	Various Materials	4,080,000.00	Ten 25 Enterprises	Maria Lea Macatangay, Brgy. Tulo, Batangas City	4,077,450.00	03.26.2024
BAC-PG-00062-2024	Rental Heavy Equipment	2,012,500.00	Rockgold Trading & Equipment Rentals	Rolly Dy Tan/Nat'l. Road, Gulod Labac, Batangas City	2,012,493.00	03.26.2024
BAC-PG-00063-2024	CCTV Surveillance Cameras	10,018,830.00	Orange IT. Exchange, Inc.	TIMOTHY RUTH EVANGELISTA /Timothy Ruth Evangelista, Unit 2415 Cityland Herrera Tower 98 V.A Rufino Cor.Valero Sts. Salcedo Village, Brgy. Bel-air, Makati City	10,017,130.00	03.26.2024
BAC-PG-00064-2024	Meals and Snacks	1,747,800.00	Norma Cleofe's Canteen	Norma Cleofe /Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	1,746,290.00	03.26.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E., EnP
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 1

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00065-2024	Massage Guns	2,800,000.00	Ten 25 Enterprises	Maria Lea Macatangay, Brgy. Tulo, Batangas City	2,799,000.00	03.26.2024
BAC-PG-00083-2024	Meals and Snacks	1,500,000.00	Tia Rosa's Catering	Mary Ann Ramirez/Alangilan Batangas City	1,499,062.50	03.26.2024
BAC-PG-00084-2024	Printing & Publication Supplies	1,131,500.00	Grandeur Printing & General Merchandise	Luzviminda A. Villena / Brgy. Paharang East, Batangas City	1,131,149.00	03.26.2024
BAC-PG-00085-2024	Various Materials	1,347,675.00	Rockgold Trading & Equipment Rentals	Rolly Dy Tan/Nat'l. Road, Gulod Labac, Batangas City	1,347,547.00	03.26.2024
BAC-PG-00097-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles	999,914.00	D. Dimaandal Car Care Center	Dante Dimaandal/Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	999,494.00	03.26.2024
BAC-PG-00098-2024	Meals & Snacks	135,250.00	Triple 8 Carindaria & Catering Sevices	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	135,992.50	03.26.2024
BAC-PG-00099-2024	Rental of Venue Including Meals & Snacks	829,000.00	Hotel Concepts, Inc.	Yuki Nakamura / Brgy. Gulod Labac, Batangas City	829,000.00	03.26.2024
BAC-PG-00100-2024	Various Maintenacne Materials	967,000.00	Rockgold Trading & Equipment Rentals	Rolly Dy Tan/Nat'l. Road, Gulod Labac, Batangas City	966,991.00	03.26.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E., EnP
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10c - Bid Results on Consulting Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

CONSULTING SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON **CALENDAR YEAR:** 2024
PROVINCE: BATANGAS **QUARTER:** 1
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Location	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
No Consultancy Services									

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E., EnP
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson