

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
**CITY/
MUNICIPALITY:** BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 2

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
1	2024-009	REHABILITATION AND IMPROVEMENT OF BARANGAY MULTIPURPOSE BUILDING AT BANABA EAST, BATANGAS CITY	4,932,098.17	BANABA EAST	VICMAR CONSTRUCTION INC.	Barangay Calicanto, Batangas City	4,926,680.00	2-Apr-24	160
2	2024-010	CONSTRUCTION OF BARANGAY MULTIPURPOSE BUILDING (PHASE II) AT BANABA SOUTH, BATANGAS CITY	1,886,916.37	BANABA SOUTH	SUNLIGHT BUILDERS AND SUPPLY	Barangay Alangilan, Batangas City	1,885,480.00	2-Apr-24	60
3	2024-011	IMPROVEMENT OF BARANGAY MULTIPURPOSE BUILDING AT BANABA CENTER, BATANGAS CITY	921,489.81	BANABA CENTER	P-SQUARE CONTRACTING & SERVICES	Barangay Catandala, Ibaan, Batangas	918,950.00	2-Apr-24	40
4	2024-012	CONSTRUCTION OF MULTIPURPOSE BUILDING AT DELA PAZ PULOT APLAYA, BATANGAS CITY	6,051,439.96	DELA PAZ PULOT APLAYA	VICMAR CONSTRUCTION INC.	Barangay Calicanto, Batangas City	6,045,680.00	2-Apr-24	160
5	2024-013	EXPANSION OF WATERWORKS SYSTEM AT SAN ISIDRO, BATANGAS CITY	6,000,000.00	SAN ISIDRO	BERTO LUCCI BUILDERS AND SUPPLY	Evangelista St., Barangay 8, Batangas City	5,998,000.00	2-Apr-24	180
6	2024-014	IMPROVEMENT AND REHABILITATION OF BARANGAY MULTIPURPOSE BUILDING AT KUMINTANG IBABA, BATANGAS CITY	3,510,231.94	KUMINTANG IBABA	SHANTES BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION	#209 Tulay na Patpat, Ibaan, Batangas	3,507,500.00	15-Apr-24	120
7	2024-015	REHABILITATION OF BARANGAY MULTIPURPOSE BUILDING AT TINGGA ITAAS, BATANGAS CITY	1,696,646.53	TINGGA ITAAS	No Bidder	N/A	N/A	15-Apr-24	64
8	2024-016	REHABILITATION OF BARANGAY MULTIPURPOSE BUILDING AT PAHARANG KANLURAN, BATANGAS CITY	2,000,000.00	PAHARANG KANLURAN	P-SQUARE CONTRACTING & SERVICES	Barangay Catandala, Ibaan, Batangas	1,999,000.00	15-Apr-24	84

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
9	2024-017	REHABILITATION OF ROAD (SITIO IBABA) AT MABACONG, BATANGAS CITY	6,718,589.63	MABACONG	Failed due to expired PCAB of EGP	N/A	N/A	15-Apr-24	180
10	2024-018	CONSTRUCTION/COMPLETION OF BARANGAY MULTIPURPOSE COVERED COURT AT GULOD LABAC, BATANGAS CITY	20,000,000.00	GULOD LABAC	NOW BUILDERS	No. 222 National Rd. Gulod Labac, Batangas City	19,992,880.00	15-Apr-24	160
11	2024-019	IMPROVEMENT AND COMPLETION OF BARANGAY MULTIPURPOSE COVERED COURT AT TINGA LABAC, BATANGAS CITY	6,000,000.00	TINGA LABAC	MATRICES CONSTRUCTION	SITIO CUMBA, SAN JOSE SICO, BATANGAS CITY	5,995,000.00	15-Apr-24	120
12	2024-020	CONSTRUCTION OF 3 STOREY 9 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT BOLBOK E/S	31,000,000.00	BOLBOK	BERTO LUCCI BUILDERS AND SUPPLY	Evangelista St., Barangay 8, Batangas City	30,998,000.00	28-May-24	240
13	2024-021	CONSTRUCTION OF 3 STOREY 9 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT LIBJO NHS	30,837,335.62	LIBJO	GCF FETALVERO CONSTRUCTION AND ENTERPRISES	De Joya Bayview Village, Batangas City	30,828,000.00	28-May-24	240
14	2024-022	CONSTRUCTION OF 3 STOREY 15 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT MAHABANG DAHILIG SHS	47,749,611.10	MAHABANG DAHILIG	NOW BUILDERS	No. 222 National Rd. Gulod Labac, Batangas City	47,738,880.00	28-May-24	312
15	2024-023	CONSTRUCTION OF 3 STOREY 12 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT STA. RITA ES	35,000,000.00	STA. RITA	VICMAR CONSTRUCTION INC.	Barangay Calicanto, Batangas City	34,989,680.00	28-May-24	260
16	2024-024	REHABILITATION OF BARANGAY ROAD WITH RIPRAP AT TALUMPOK SILANGAN, (SITIO TANAUAN-SAPANGAN)	12,000,000.00	TALUMPOK SILANGAN	NOW BUILDERS	No. 222 National Rd. Gulod Labac, Batangas City	11,990,880.00	28-May-24	154
17	2024-032	CONSTRUCTION OF BARANGAY HEALTH STATION/CENTER AT TALAHIB PAYAPA, BATANGAS CITY	3,488,870.30	TALAHIB PAYAPA	RRE ERECTOR'S CONSTRUCTION AND TRADING SPECIALIST	67 Evangelista Street, Batangas City	3,485,000.00	28-May-24	140
18	2024-033	CONSTRUCTION OF BARANGAY HEALTH STATION/CENTER AT HALIGUE KANLURAN, BATANGAS CITY	3,918,900.00	HALIGUE KANLURAN	EGP CONSTRUCTION & ENT.	Magnusville, Subdivision, Pallocan Kanluran, Batangas City	3,915,800.00	28-May-24	152
19	2024-015	REHABILITATION OF BARANGAY MULTIPURPOSE BUILDING AT TINGGA ITAAS, BATANGAS CITY	1,962,034.46	TINGGA ITAAS	KERAND BUILDERS AND SUPPLY	#19 Ms. Philippines St., Batangas City	1,959,450.00	28-May-24	84

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
20	2024-017	REHABILITATION OF ROAD (SITIO IBABA) AT MABACONG, BATANGAS CITY	6,718,589.63	MABACONG	EGP CONSTRUCTION & ENT.	Magnusville, Subdivision, Pallocan Kanluran, Batangas City	6,715,500.00	28-May-24	180
21	2024-026	IMPROVEMENT OF BARANGAY MULTIPURPOSE BUILDING AT SORO SORO IBABA, BATANGAS CITY	4,692,666.00	SORO SORO IBABA	EGP CONSTRUCTION & ENT.	Magnusville, Subdivision, Pallocan Kanluran, Batangas City	4,690,000.00	26-Jun-24	160
22	2024-028	CONSTRUCTION OF 2 STOREY 4 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT SAN JOSE SICO ES	17,076,707.78	SAN JOSE SICO	R.M. TEJADA CONSTRUCTION AND SUPPLIES CORP.	MS. MARISSA C. TEJADA Sitio Cumba, San Jose Sico, Batangas City	17,067,000.00	26-Jun-24	240
23	2024-029	CONSTRUCTION OF 3 STOREY 12 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT BANABA WEST IS	39,188,182.83	BANABA WEST	VICMAR CONSTRUCTION INC.	Barangay Calicanto, Batangas City	39,180,680.00	26-Jun-24	260
24	2024-030	CONSTRUCTION OF 2 STOREY 4 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT HALIGUE SILANGAN NHS	15,000,000.00	HALIGUE SILANGAN	VICMAR CONSTRUCTION INC.	Barangay Calicanto, Batangas City	14,994,680.00	26-Jun-24	240
25	2024-031	CONSTRUCTION OF 2 CLASSROOM SCHOOL BUILDING AT HALIGUE KANLURAN ES	7,366,026.89	HALIGUE KANLURAN	KERAND BUILDERS AND SUPPLY	#19 Ms. Philippines St., Batangas City	7,362,850.00	26-Jun-24	200
26	2024-034	CONSTRUCTION OF BARANGAY HEALTH STATION/CENTER AT SAN ANTONIO, ISLA VERDE, BATANGAS CITY	5,000,000.00	SAN ANTONIO ISLA VERDE	GCF FETALVERO CONSTRUCTION AND ENTERPRISES	De Joya Bayview Village, Batangas City	4,996,100.00	26-Jun-24	200
27	2024-035	REPAIR OF EBD HE SB AT TIBIG ES AT TALAHIB PANDAYAN, BATANGAS CITY	2,844,884.12	TALAHIB PANDAYAN	SHANTES BUILDERS DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION	#209 Tulay na Patpat, Ibaan, Batangas	2,842,000.00	26-Jun-24	80
28	2024-038	REPAIR/IMPROVEMENT OF SCHOOL BUILDING BATANGAS CITY EAST ES (CEILING AND ROOFING) SDS OFFICE AT BARANGAY 6, BATANGAS CITY	883,574.02	BARANGAY 6	SUNLIGHT BUILDERS AND SUPPLY	Barangay Alangilan, Batangas City	882,000.00	26-Jun-24	40

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd
EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E., EnP
BAC Secretariat Head

sgd
MANOLO M. PERLADA
BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00096-2024	Repair & maintenance of various airconditioning units	4,490,000.00	Jaime B.M. Refrigeration & Airconditioning	Jaime B. Magadia/Brgy. Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	4,488,510.00	04.08.2024
BAC-PG-00101-2024	Submersible Pump	1,035,000.00	Nemar Lumber & Hardware Corp.	Philip Chua / Brgy. Calicanto, Batangas City	1,033,800.00	04.16.2024
BAC-PG-00102-2024	Upgraded Female Cattle	1,890,000.00	Nutrilink Enterprises	Eleuterio M. Mercado / Purok 4, Brgy. Bolbok, Lipa City	1,888,950.00	04.16.2024
BAC-PG-00103-2024	Various Materials	1,634,210.00	State Construction & Mill Supply	Virginia Cortes/D. Silang St., Batangas City	1,610,900.00	04.16.2024
BAC-PG-00113-2024	Repair & maintenance of various airconditioning units	630,246.00	D. Dimaandal Car Care Center	Dante Dimaandal/Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	630,046.00	04.16.2024
BAC-PG-00115-2024	Sport Supplies & Office Equipment	979,050.00	Chels & Clyde Trading	Marian M. Mendoza / Laguna Hills Subd. Pansol, Calamba City	978,750.00	04.16.2024
BAC-PG-00117-2024	Meals & Snacks	117,000.00	Citi Chow Corp.	Carlito Go /Citimart Complex, Rizal Avenue	117,000.00	04.16.2024
BAC-PG-00118-2024	Various Maintenance Materials	945,655.00	Cosworx Trading	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	944,415.00	04.16.2024
BAC-PG-00119-2024	Various Office Supplies	403,269.00	Ten 25 Enterprises	Maria Lea Macatangay, Brgy. Tulo, Batangas City	403,200.00	04.16.2024
BAC-PG-00120-2024	Plaques	185,400.00	Gold & Silver Metal Arts & General Merchandise	Rolando Mendoza /D. Silang St., Batangas City	185,381.00	04.16.2024
BAC-PG-00121-2024	Meals & Snacks	521,020.00	Norma Cleofe's Canteen	Norma Cleofe /Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	519,918.00	04.16.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head (PG)

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00126-2024	Various Office Supplies & Materials	663,777.74	Smartbiz Trading & General Merchandise	Wherlyn Manansala/#10 Buenafe St., Brgy. 19, Batangas City	663,477.74	04.19.2024
BAC-PG-00127-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles	500,139.00	D. Dimaandal Car Care Center	Dante Dimaandal/Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	500,000.00	04.19.2024
BAC-PG-00128-2024	Meals & Snacks	596,800.00	Triple 8 Carinderia & Catering Sevices	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	794,450.00	04.19.2024
BAC-PG-00129-2024	Various Tarpaulins, Pamphlets & Letterhead	298,665.00	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	298,585.00	04.19.2024
BAC-PG-00112-2024 LOT III	Two (2) Units Sport Utility Vehicle	4,376,000.00	SFM Sales Corp.	Eusebio N. Dy Jr. / 115 Ile De France St. Sta.Rosa Vill 4A, Sta.Rosa, Laguna	4,374,000.00	04.23.2024
BAC-PG-00123-2024	Meals & Snacks	1,032,340.00	Triple 8 Carinderia & Catering Sevices	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	1,032,038.00	04.23.2024
BAC-PG-00133-2024	Rice	660,000.00	NDK Rice Store	Danny Kaye V. Macatangay / Stall No. 03-R 0028 Rice Section, NBCPM, Cuta, Batangas City	659,200.00	04.23.2024
BAC-PG-00135-2024	Various Supplies	534,050.00	Grandeur Printing & General Merchandise	Luzviminda A. Villena / Brgy. Paharang East, Batangas City	533,870.00	04.23.2024
BAC-PG-00136-2024	Various Maintenance Materials	620,455.00	Rockgold Trading & Equipment Rentals	Rolly Dy Tan/Nat'l. Road, Gulod Labac, Batangas City	620,411.00	04.23.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head (PG)

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00137-2024	Meals & Snacks	618,800.00	Casadesofia Restaurant	Banaba South, Diversion Road, Batangas City	618,355.00	04.23.2024
BAC-PG-00138-2024	Various Office Supplies & Equipment	767,175.00	Mel - C Trading	Imelda C. Caronel /Brgy. Pinagkrusan, Alitagtag, Batangas	766,975.00	04.23.2024
BAC-PG-00139-2024	Meals & Snacks	191,700.00	Grandiose Food Services, Inc.	Felie Go/D. Silang St., cor P. Burgos St. Pob. 14, Batangas City	190,070.00	04.23.2024
BAC-PG-00142-2024	Meals & Snacks	732,400.00	Norma Cleofe's Canteen	Norma Cleofe /Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	732,009.00	04.26.2024
BAC-PG-00143-2024	Various Office Supplies & Equipment	573,704.00	1 SBMA Supply Wholesaling	Paul Andrew P. Abong / 710 – 716 Quirino Highway, San Bartolome, Novaliches, Quezon City	573,204.00	04.26.2024
BAC-PG-00144-2024	Repair & Maintenance of Road Grader	361,409.00	Civic Merchandising Inc.	Paul Andrew P. Abong / 710 – 716 Quirino Highway, San Bartolome, Novaliches, Quezon City	361,409.00	04.26.2024
BAC-PG-00145-2024	Meals & Snacks	647,400.00	Norma Cleofe's Canteen	Norma Cleofe /Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	647,100.00	04.26.2024
BAC-PG-00146-2024	Various Office Supplies & Materials	198,401.40	Smartbiz Trading & General Merchandise	Wherlyn Manansala/#10 Buenafe St., Brgy. 19, Batangas City	198,299.90	04.26.2024
BAC-PG-00147-2024	Various Maintenance Materials	940,530.00	Berto Lucci Builders & Supply	Myrna D. Loyola / No.67Evangelista St., Poblacion 08, Batangas City	939,710.00	04.26.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head (PG)

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00148-2024	Rental of Venue Including Meals & Snacks	240,000.00	Hotel Concepts, Inc.	Yuki Nakamura / Brgy. Gulod Labac, Batangas City	240,000.00	04.26.2024
BAC-PG-00149-2024	Handcuffs& Target Board	528,000.00	ABCC Sales & Services	Claudia Girlie C. Marcial / ABCC Bldg., M.H. Del Pilar St., Pob. 001, Batangas City	525,480.00	04.26.2024
BAC-PG-00151-2024	Meals & Snacks	296,000.00	Casadesofia Restaurant	Banaba South, Diversion Road, Batangas City	294,880.00	04.26.24
BAC-PG-00152-2024	Rice	854,750.00	NDK Rice Store	Danny Kaye V. Macatangay / Stall No. 03-R 0028 Rice Section, NBCPM, Cuta, Batangas City	853,698.00	04.26.24
BAC-PG-00155-2024	Various Materials	219,200.00	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas	219,175.00	04.26.2024
BAC-PG-00132-2024	Meals & Snacks	672,000.00	Triple 8 Carinderia & Catering Sevices	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	671,345.00	04.28.2024
BAC-PG-00124-2024	Science Laboratory Furniture	25,050,000.00	Rei Angel's Enterprise	Marcelina Matienzo / RBL Bldg. Illustre Ave., District IV, Lemery, Batangas	25,048,500.00	05.03.2024
BAC-PG-00156-2024	Meals & Snacks	214,740.00	Triple 8 Carinderia & Catering Sevices	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	214,650.00	05.03.2024
BAC-PG-00157-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles	572,284.00	D. Dimaandal Car Care Center	Dante Dimaandal/Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	572,084.00	05.03.24
BAC-PG-00158-2024	Various Materials	521,005.00	Cosworx Trading	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	520,100.00	05.03.24

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head (PG)

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00159-2024	Various Medicines, Medical & Laboratory Supplies	365,394.25	P.A. Mendoza Trading & General Merchandise	Prudencio Mendoza / 676 Apacible St., Poblacion 010, Batangas City	365,194.25	05.03.2024
BAC-PG-00160-2024	Meals & Snacks	699,983.00	Citi Chow Corp.	Carlito Go /Citimart Complex, Rizal Avenue	699,428.70	05.03.2024
BAC-PG-00161-2024	Hygienic Kit & Collapsible Stretcher	144,000.00	558 Pharmacy & Convenience Store	Marcelina Matienzo / Ilustre Ave., Dist. III, Lemery Batangas	143,920.00	05.03.2024
BAC-PG-00131-2024	Meals & Snacks	1,502,600.00	Casadesofia Restaurant	Banaba South, Diversion Road, Batangas City	1,485,474.00	05.07.2024
BAC-PG-00140-2024	Various Maintenance Materials	1,344,940.00	Rockgold Trading & Equipment Rentals	Rolly Dy Tan/Nat'l. Road, Gulod Labac, Batangas City	1,344,847.00	05.07.2024
BAC-PG-00164-2024	Meals & Snacks	353,100.00	Triple 8 Carinderia & Catering Services	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	353,050.00	05.10.2024
BAC-PG-00165-2024	Siphoning & Manhole Cleaning Services	500,000.00	Wastecon, Inc.	Fe Isidra D. Faytaren / Sitio Catmon, Brgy. San Jose Sico, Batangas City	500,000.00	05.10.2024
BAC-PG-00166-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles	554,710.00	Automatic Motors	Ma. Arlene Montalbo / Brgy. Balagtas, Batangas City	554,106.00	05.10.2024
BAC-PG-00167-2024	Polo Shirt, T-Shirt & Tote Bag	217,570.00	Tatao Shirt & General Merchandise	Tomas E. Mojares / P. Torres St., Brgy. 3, Lipa City	217,474.00	05.10.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head (PG)

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00168-2024	Meals & Snacks	223,856.00	Citi Chow Corp.	Carlito Go /Citimart Complex, Rizal Avenue	223,856.00	05.10.2024
BAC-PG-00169-2024	Various Materials	588,100.00	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	588,012.00	05.10.2024
BAC-PG-00170-2024	Replacement of Electronic Control Module of Response Boat	135,093.00	Solanda Enterprises Inc.	Kenneth Ngo / MagallanesSts. 730 Brgy. 655 Intramuros, Manila NCR, City of Manila	134,500.00	05.10.2024
BAC-PG-00171-2024	Various Materials	71,150.00	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	71,145.00	05.10.2024
BAC-PG-00173-2024	Physical Devices	999,963.00	Smartbiz Trading & General Merchandise	Wherlyn Manansala/#10 Buenafe St., Brgy. 19, Batangas City	999,463.00	05.14.2024
BAC-PG-00174-2024	Various Office Supplies	191,957.52	Philippine Duplicators, Inc.	Maria Teresa Navarro / CCC Bldg. KM 14 West Service Road Edison Ave., Merville, Paranaque City	191,811.00	05.14.2024
BAC-PG-00175-2024	Various Maintenance Materials	513,264.50	State Construction & Mill Supply	Virginia Cortes/D. Silang St., Batangas City	513,246.00	05.14.2024
BAC-PG-00176-2024	Various Fixtures	245,086.60	Society Glass and Gabriel Builders, Inc.	Teresa T. Co / National Road, Brgy. Bolbok Batangas City	245,000.00	05.14.2024
BAC-PG-00177-2024	Office Supplies & Equipment	790,340.65	Smartbiz Trading & General Merchandise	Wherlyn Manansala/#10 Buenafe St., Brgy. 19, Batangas City	790,040.65	05.14.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head (PG)

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00178-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles	294,904.00	D. Dimaandal Car Care Center	Dante Dimaandal/Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	294,800.00	05.14.2024
BAC-PG-00141-2024	Speech Laboratory Furniture	13,500,000.00	Rei Angel's Enterprise	Marcelina Matienzo / RBL Bldg.Illustre Ave., District IV, Lemery, Batangas	13,497,990.00	05.16.2024
BAC-PG-00153-2024	Various Maintenance Materials	1,060,240.00	Native Lumber	Remegia V. Tan / Brgy. KumintangIbaba, Batangas City	1,059,000.00	05.16.2024
BAC-PG-00154-2024	Arm Chairs (for Elementary & Secondary)	7,840,000.00	Rei Angel's Enterprise	Marcelina Matienzo / RBL Bldg.Illustre Ave., District IV, Lemery, Batangas	7,836,680.00	05.16.2024
BAC-PG-00162-2024	Preventive Maintenance of Various Airconditioning Units	1,468,000.00	Terravita Construction Trading	Pauleen Turgo / Sitio Duluhan, Cuta Batangas City	1,456,050.00	05.16.2024
BAC-PG-00182-2024	Meals & Snacks	334,000.00	Triple 8 Carinderia & Catering Sevices	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	333,597.00	05.17.2024
BAC-PG-00183-2024	Various Maintenance Materials	629,615.00	Rockgold Trading & Equipment Rentals	Rolly Dy Tan/Nat'l. Road, Gulod Labac,Batangas City	629,583.00	05.17.2024
BAC-PG-00184-2024	Fabricated Manhole Cover	960,000.00	Society Glass and Gabriel Builders, Inc.	Teresa T. Co / National Road, Brgy. Bolbok Batangas City	959,600.00	05.17.2024
BAC-PG-00185-2024	X-Ray Films	251,780.00	Patient Care Corp.	Alfrito D. Mah / AMHSCO BLDG., Mc Arthur Highway Dolores, San Fernando City, Pampanga	251,736.00	05.17.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head (PG)

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON **CALENDAR YEAR:** 2024
PROVINCE: BATANGAS **QUARTER:** 2
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00186-2024	Meals and Snacks	930,000.00	Tia Rosa's Catering	Mary Ann Ramirez/Alangilan Batangas City	929,500.00	05.17.2024
BAC-PG-00187-2024	Various Supplies & Equipment	872,310.00	Gensson Trade Corp.	Alberto Uy Bomping / 29. P Zamora St.,Brgy. 16, Batangas City	871,860.00	05.17.2024
BAC-PG-00193-2024	Various Maintenance Materials	989,460.00	Cosworx Trading	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	988,185.00	05.21.2024
BAC-PG-00194-2024	Rental & Services of Sounds, Lights, Complete Stage and Aluminum Trusses	100,000.00	RMA Lights & Sounds	Ramon R. Tayer, RMA Lights & Sounds. Salaban II, Ibaan, Batangas	99,950.00	05.21.2024
BAC-PG-00195-2024	Flower Decoration, Corsage, Boutonniere, Lei & Stage Flowers	153,450.00	Fioridella Flowershop	Wilfredo G. Tongco / Unit 9 Mayvel Center, Pallocan Kanluran, Batangas City	153,350.00	05.21.2024
BAC-PG-00196-2024	Repair of Various Airconditioning Units	165,750.00	Terravita Construction Trading	Pauleen Turgo / Sitio Duluhan, Cuta Batangas City	163,800.00	05.21.2024
BAC-PG-00197-2024	Various Office Supplies	187,468.00	Gakken Philippines, Inc.	Liza Q. Mendoza, #130 Aurora Boulevard Cor. A Lake St. Salapan, San Juan City	186,868.00	05.21.2024
BAC-PG-00198-2024	Blue Printing of Citation Ticket & Property Sticker	395,560.00	Grandeur Printing & General Merchandise	Luzviminda A. Villena / Brgy. Paharang East, Batangas City	84,980.00	05.21.2024
BAC-PG-00199-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles	231,282.00	D. Dimaandal Car Care Center	Dante Dimaandal/Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	231,182.00	05.21.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head (PG)

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00179-2024	Various Maintenance Materials	1,151,900.00	Cosworx Trading	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	1,150,550.00	05.28.2024
BAC-PG-00180-2024	Meals & Snacks	1,115,200.00	Triple 8 Carinderia & Catering Sevices	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	1,114,580.00	05.28.2024
BAC-PG-00181-2024	Cartridge-Based Nucleic Acid Amplification Test & Mycobacterium Tuberculosis Test Kit	1,872,059.00	Macare Medicals Inc.	Florizel Q. De Pano / Aurora Grand 1005, Aurora Blvd. Project 3 Quezon City	1,872,050.00	05.28.2024
BAC-PG-00203-2024	Various Maintenance Materials	912,460.00	Nemar Lumber & Hardware Corp.	Philip Chua / Brgy. Calicanto, Batangas City	909,539.00	05.28.2024
BAC-PG-00204-2024	Meals & Snacks	208,500.00	Triple 8 Carinderia & Catering Sevices	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	208,297.50	05.28.2024
BAC-PG-00205-2024	Annual Surveillance Extension Audit	133,280.00	TUV Nord Philippines Inc.	Jocelyn P. Magat / Unit 603-609 Common Goal Tower MBP Ayala Alabang, Muntinglupa City	133,280.00	05.28.2024
BAC-PG-00206-2024	Rental of Sound System, Lights, LED Wall & Stage Trusses Set-Up	100,000.00	DVD Power Beat Mobile	Dante V. Dimaandal, Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	99,950.00	05.28.2024
BAC-PG-00191-2024	Rental of Motor Vehicle including Driver	2,168,000.00	D. Dimaandal Car Care Center	Dante Dimaandal/Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	2,168,000.00	05.30.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.
MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head (PG)

sgd.
MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00192-2024	Tree Cutting Services	4,999,000.00	JSA, Inc.	June Micoso /5TH Flr., BJS Bldg. 1869 Sto Domingo St., Kasilawan, Makati City	4,998,000.00	05.30.2024
BAC-PG-00208-2024	Various Tarpaulins, Pamphlets & Letterhead	140,625.00	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	140,610.00	05.30.2024
BAC-PG-00209-2024	Self Priming Pump with Pressure Gauge & Pressure Switch	215,200.00	Gensson Trade Corp.	Alberto Uy Bomping / 29. P Zamora St.,Brgy. 16, Batangas City	215,000.00	05.30.2024
BAC-PG-00210-2024	Meals & Snacks	98,600.00	Norma Cleofe's Canteen	Norma Cleofe /Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	98,600.00	05.30.2024
BAC-PG-00211-2024	Repair and Maintenance of Various Service Vehicles	247,139.00	D. Dimaandal Car Care Center	Dante Dimaandal/Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	246,989.00	05.30.2024
BAC-PG-00212-2024	Various Maintenance Materials	605,048.00	State Construction & Mill Supply	Virginia Cortes/D. Silang St., Batangas City	605,023.00	05.30.2024
BAC-PG-00200-2024	Goods & Commodities	1,239,350.00	Ten 25 Enterprises	Maria Lea Macatangay, Brgy. Tulo, Batangas City	1,235,245.00	06.06.2024
BAC-PG-00201-2024	Various Maintenance Materials	1,205,063.30	Cosworx Trading	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	1,203,853.00	06.06.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head (PG)

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00202-2024	Structured Cabling & IT Room Network	1,771,615.12	D2rmb Solutions Inc.	Alton Gless Angeles II, 3/F 2104 Santisima Trinidad Sampaloc, Manila	1,769,614.00	06.06.2024
BAC-PG-00218-2024	Meals & Snacks	536,700.00	Triple 8 Carinderia & Catering Sevices	Melvin Lee Tan/Pastor Rd., Brgy Cuta, Batangas City	536,295.00	06.06.2024
BAC-PG-00219-2024	Trophies & Medals	999,650.00	Ten 25 Enterprises	Maria Lea Macatangay, Brgy. Tulo, Batangas City	999,547.75	06.06.2024
BAC-PG-00220-2024	Stickers & PR Forms	502,060.00	Grandeur Printing & General Merchandise	Luzviminda A. Villena / Brgy. Paharang East, Batangas City	501,860.00	06.06.2024
BAC-PG-00221-2024	Meals & Snacks	406,700.00	Casadesofia Restaurant	Banaba South, Diversion Road, Batangas City	405,812.00	06.06.2024
BAC-PG-00222-2024	Various Supplies & Equipment	256,580.00	Smartbiz Trading & General Merchandise	Wherlyn Manansala/#10 Buenafe St., Brgy. 19, Batangas City	256,280.00	06.06.2024
BAC-PG-00223-2024	Asian Gen. Merchandise	389,972.00	Asian General Merchandise	Estelita A. Alda / SitioMalaya, PinamucanIbaba, Batangas City	389,830.00	06.06.2024
BAC-PG-00224-2024	Various Tarpaulins, Pamphlets & Letterhead	552,430.00	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	552,408.00	06.06.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head (PG)

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00232-2024	Meals & Snacks	250,000.00	PCK Trade And Realty Corporaation	Patrick P. AO / Bolbok, Batangas City	250,000.00	06.14.2024
BAC-PG-00233-2024	Various Office Supplies & Materials	546,026.75	Ten 25 Enterprises	Maria Lea Macatangay, Brgy. Tulo, Batangas City	545,066.25	06.14.2024
BAC-PG-00234-2024	Various Tarpaulins, Stickers, Sintra Board & T-Shirt	123,050.00	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	123,025.00	06.14.2024
BAC-PG-00235-2024	Tote Bag, Jacket & T-Shirt	197,050.00	Tatao Shirt & General Merchandise	Tomas E. Mojares / P. Torres St., Brgy. 3, Lipa City	196,999.00	06.14.2024
BAC-PG-00213-2024	Smart TV with Bracket	3,827,000.00	Geschaft Equipment Corporation	Gerald F. Mata / 3rd Flr. 100-A Dr. Lazcano St. Laging Handa, District 4, Quezon City	3,827,000.00	06.24.2024
BAC-PG-00214-2024	Response / Rescue Jetski	5,980,000.00	ALS Marine Center Corporation	Arturo C. Supangan / ALS Bldg., 7393 Bakawan St., San Antonio	5,978,000.00	06.24.2024
BAC-PG-00225-2024	Janitorial Services	1,320,270.00	AGP Sales and Building Services Inc.	Antonio G. Perez / 90 D. Silang St., Poblacion 7 Batangas City	1,320,255.00	06.24.2024
BAC-PG-00226-2024	Security Services	2,125,440.00	Nino Jesus Security Services Corp.	Ruel S. Saonoy / 215 Arce Subdivision, Kumintang Ibaba, Batangas City	2,125,434.00	06.24.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head (PG)

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00215-2024	Bokashi Eco-Balls	36,400,000.00	Verde Solutions & Innovations Corp.	Jennifer C. Mabituin / U-407 F. Jade Center, 105 Shaw Blvd.Oranbo, Pasig City	36,395,450.00	06.26.2024
BAC-PG-00216-2024	Organic Odor Eliminator	30,800,000.00	Verde Solutions & Innovations Corp.	Jennifer C. Mabituin / U-407 F. Jade Center, 105 Shaw Blvd.Oranbo, Pasig City	30,798,240.00	06.26.2024
BAC-PG-00217-2024	Livestock Organic Disinfectant	32,725,000.00	Verde Solutions & Innovations Corp.	Jennifer C. Mabituin / U-407 F. Jade Center, 105 Shaw Blvd.Oranbo, Pasig City	32,723,130.00	06.26.2024
BAC-PG-00227-2024	Various Tarpaulins & Flyers	1,005,600.00	Goldmine Printing Press	Editha Santos/Evangelista St., Brgy. 8 Batangas City	1,005,500.00	06.26.2024
BAC-PG-00228-2024	Various Office Equipment	1,666,220.00	1 SBMA Supply Wholesaling	Paul Andrew P. Abong / 710 – 716 Quirino Highway, San Bartolome, Novaliches, Quezon City	1,665,000.00	06.26.2024
BAC-PG-00229-2024 LOT I	Various Medicines	3,000,952.50	Ava Meds Drug Distribution	Evangeline P. Damaso / 2nd Floor B3 222 CDE Bldg. Chipeco Ave., Brgy. 3, Calamba City	2,998,783.75	06.26.2024
BAC-PG-00229-2024 LOT II	Various Medicines	3,003,105.00	558 Pharmacy & Convenience Store	Marcelina Matienzo / Ilustre Ave., Dist. III, Lemery Batangas	3,002,590.00	06.26.2024
BAC-PG-00229-2024 LOT III	Various Medicines	3,003,390.00	P.A. Mendoza Trading & General Merchandise	Prudencio Mendoza / 676 Apacible St., Poblacion 010, Batangas City	3,002,720.00	06.26.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head (PG)

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON
PROVINCE: BATANGAS
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024
QUARTER: 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for the Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address Of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
BAC-PG-00229-2024 LOT IV	Various Medicines	1,002,770.00	Paville Pharma Trading	Patrina P. Villanueva / Muzon San Luis, Batangas	1,001,953.00	06.26.2024
BAC-PG-00229-2024 LOT V	Various Medicines	1,000,846.25	Theracor Generics (Phil.)	Efren Delos Reyes / 20 Oliveros Dr. Apolonio Samsan	1,000,604.25	06.26.2024
BAC-PG-00229-2024 LOT VI	Various Medicines	999,555.00	558 Pharmacy & Convinience Store	Marcelina Matienzo / Illustre Ave., Dist. III, Lemery Batangas	999,000.00	06.26.2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd.

MARISSA D. GUADEZ
 BAC Secretariat Head (PG)

sgd.

MANOLO PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10c - Bid Results on Consulting Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

CONSULTING SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION IV-A - CALABARZON **CALENDAR YEAR:** 2024
PROVINCE: BATANGAS **QUARTER:** 2
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: BATANGAS CITY (Capital)

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Location	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
No Consultancy Services									

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

sgd
EDGAR G. FESTIJO, C.E., EnP
 BAC Secretariat Head

sgd
MANOLO M. PERLADA
 BAC Chairperson